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In the world of tea, where tradition often holds sway, Edwina Fort is a
refreshing force of innovation. As the founder and CEO of Hitta Tea Maker,
she is challenging the status quo and transforming the way we enjoy this
beloved beverage. With her patented tea brewing system and unwavering
commitment to ethical sourcing, Fort is not only creating exceptional teas
but also empowering tea farmers and promoting sustainability.

The Hitta Tea Maker: Revolutionizing Tea Brewing

At the heart of Hitta Tea Maker lies Fort's ingenious tea brewing system.
Designed to optimize the flavor and aroma of loose-leaf tea, the Hitta
device features a unique double-walled glass chamber and a patented
steeping process. This innovative design allows users to precisely control
the brewing time and temperature, ensuring that each cup of tea is brewed
to perfection.

Unlike traditional teapots, the Hitta Tea Maker extracts the full potential of
loose-leaf tea, releasing its rich flavors and delicate nuances. The double-
walled glass chamber retains heat, allowing the tea leaves to steep longer
without becoming bitter. The result is a smooth, flavorful cup of tea that
showcases the true character of the leaves.
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Ethical Sourcing: Empowering Tea Farmers

Fort's passion for tea extends beyond creating exceptional brews. As an
advocate for ethical sourcing, she works closely with tea farmers around
the world to ensure that they are fairly compensated and that their
communities are supported. Hitta Tea Maker partners with small-scale tea
farmers who practice sustainable farming techniques, preserving the
environment and protecting the livelihoods of these dedicated growers.

Through transparent supply chain practices, Fort ensures that the proceeds
from Hitta teas reach the hands of those who deserve them most. By
empowering tea farmers and promoting fair trade, she is not only
supporting sustainable tea cultivation but also contributing to the social and
economic well-being of tea-producing regions.

Sustainability: Brewing a Greener Future

Sustainability is an integral aspect of Hitta Tea Maker's mission. Fort is
committed to reducing the environmental impact of tea production and
consumption. The Hitta device is designed to be durable and reusable,
minimizing waste. Additionally, Hitta partners with organizations that
promote reforestation and environmental protection in tea-growing regions.

By embracing sustainable practices, Hitta Tea Maker is not only brewing
delicious tea but also contributing to the preservation of ecosystems that
support tea cultivation. Fort believes that tea can be a catalyst for positive
change in the world, and she is determined to make Hitta a force for
sustainability in the tea industry.

Edwina Fort: The Visionary Behind Hitta



Edwina Fort's journey to tea entrepreneurship is a testament to her
passion, determination, and belief in the power of innovation. Growing up in
the tea-growing region of Kenya, she witnessed firsthand the challenges
faced by tea farmers. Her desire to improve their lives and create a positive
impact on the tea industry sparked the inspiration for Hitta Tea Maker.

With a background in engineering and design, Fort set out to create a tea
brewing system that could unlock the full potential of loose-leaf tea while
empowering tea farmers. Her vision for Hitta was not just to make a great
cup of tea but to create a sustainable and ethical tea company that would
make a difference in the world.

Edwina Fort and Hitta Tea Maker are transforming the tea industry by
combining innovation, ethical sourcing, and sustainability. The patented
Hitta Tea Maker allows tea enthusiasts to experience the true flavor and
aroma of loose-leaf tea, while its commitment to ethical sourcing empowers
tea farmers and promotes sustainability.

As a trailblazing entrepreneur and a passionate advocate for tea, Edwina
Fort is changing the way we enjoy tea and making a positive impact on the
world. Hitta Tea Maker is not just a tea brewing system; it is a symbol of
innovation, ethical practices, and a brighter future for the tea industry.
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